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 TODAY’S SERVICE

CULTIVATING CONNECTION WITH SELF, OTHERS, THE WIDE WORLD, AND GOD


FEEL FREE TO USE PRONOUNS OF YOUR CHOICE FOR ALL SONGS AND PRAYERS 
Chimes


Gathering Statement

We gather this morning to connect with the Divine, with 
ourselves, with each other, and with the Oneness of all 
Creation. We gather because inclusive community built 
around shared stories and rituals inspires us to pursue 
justice and live out our values.


Song: Come Fall On Us 

(Benoit Pasley Henry, Robin D Pasley)


A thankful heart

Prepares the way for you my God

A thankful heart

Prepares the way for you my God

Come fall on us, we fall on you

A thankful heart will be our rhythm

Come fall on us, we fall on you

A thankful heart will be our song


Sarum Prayer 

God be in my head 

	 and in my understanding;       

God be in my eyes

	 and in my looking;

God be in my mouth

	 and in my speaking;           

God be in my heart

	 and in my thinking;

God be at my end

	 and at my departing


A reading from Psalm 46:

There is a river whose streams bring happiness to God’s 
city, to the holy city of God Most High. God is in that city, 
so it will never be destroyed. They are there to help even 
before sunrise. Nations will shake and kingdoms will fall 
when God shouts and makes the earth move. The Lord 
All-Powerful is with us. The God of Jacob is our place of 
safety. 


Dismiss the Kids

Announcements

Sermon


Candles


Remembering the Names: Patrick Lyoya, Clarence 
Leading Fighter, Tamir Rice, Delaina Ashley Yuan, Freddie 
Gray, Andre Mackneil, Mario Gonzalez, Diamond Sanders, 
Philando Castille, Sandra Bland, Amarjeet Johal, Daoyou 
Feng, Andre Hill, Hyun Jung Grant, Akai Gurley, Paul 
Castaway, Elijah McClain, Ramon Timothy Lopez, 
Katherine Massey, Jonathan Tubby, and those we haven’t 
named. We hold them and their families in our hearts.


Prayer for Loved Ones: Peter and Susan, John and Sue, 
Diane, Marcia and Tom, Manoj, Nancy, Emily, the 
Diamond family, the McCormick family, Lisa & Jason, MJ, 
Jack & Mai (pronounced "my"), Rhonda & family, Jim, 
Kurt, Deb and Jim, Dave and Heather, Kris, Kharin, Mike 
and Janine, Brian, Natalie, Linda, Ken and Eleanor, Eddie, 
Kevin, Holly Ann, Pat, Mindy, William, Caleb, Anne, 
Lauretta, Bob, Bishop Yvette Flunder, Bishop Bonnie 
Perry, Bishop Darrell Goodwin, Bishop Tim Wolfe, Lilliana, 
Leah, Alicia, Patrisse, Opal, Ozone House, immigrants and 
those we lift up in silence.


Communion


Call and Response:

Leader: The Lord be with you!

People: And also with you.

Leader: Lift up your hearts!

People: We lift them up unto the Lord.

Leader: Let us give thanks to the Lord our God.

People: It is right to give God thanks and praise.


The Lord’s Prayer

Our Creator in heaven, hallowed be your name. 

Your kin_dom come, your will be done, 

on earth as it is in heaven.

Give us today our daily bread.

And forgive us our sins,

as we forgive those who sin against us.

Save us from the time of trial, 

and deliver us from evil.

For the kin_dom, the power, and the glory are yours. Now 
and forever. Amen.
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Song: Revelation Song

(Jennie Lee Riddle)


Worthy is the Lamb who was slain

Holy, holy is He

Sing a new song to Him who sits on

Heaven's mercy seat


Holy, holy, holy is the Lord God Almighty

Who was and is and is to come

With all creation I sing praise to the King of kings

You are my everything and I will adore You


Clothed in rainbows of living color

Flashes of lightning rolls of thunder

Blessing and honor strength and glory and power be

To You the only wise King


Filled with wonder awestruck wonder

At the mention of Your name

Jesus Your name is power, breath and living water

Such a marvelous mystery


Song: Stand In Your Love

(Ethan Hulse, Josh Baldwin, Marcus R. Harris, Rita 
Springer)


When darkness tries to roll over my bones

When sorrow comes to steal the joy I own

When brokenness and pain is all I know

Oh, I won't be shaken, no, I won't be shaken


My fear doesn't stand a chance

When I stand in Your love

My fear doesn't stand a chance

When I stand in Your love

My fear doesn't stand a chance

When I stand in Your love!


Shame no longer has a place to hide

I am not a captive to the lies

I'm not afraid to leave my past behind

Oh, I won't be shaken, no, I won't be shaken!


There's power that can break off every chain

There's power that can empty out a grave

There's resurrection power that can save

There's power in Your name, power in Your name


Benediction


Scan to Give Online with EasyTithe:
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